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What do you normally use to take photos and/or 
video recordings?

Canon 70D digital camera with a 100-400mm 
lens, a Panasonic Lumix DCX80 “point and shoot” 
digital camera, and an iPhone 11.

Which statement best describes your use of 
cameras?

-I use cameras to practice the art of photography, 
either professional or amateur professional.

-I use cameras to take pictures of people, places, 
animals, and things for personal reasons.

-I use cameras to help me remember things or to 
document something.

Do you prefer taking photos or videos? Photos.  Will take videos once a month.

How often do you take photos and/or video 
recordings?

Several times a week

Do you take photos and/or videos for personal or 
professional reasons?

Personal

What kinds of things do you like to take photos/
videos of? 

Anything that has to do with nature, plants, 
animals and herbs.

Are there any other tasks that you do with your 
phone camera other than taking photographs or 
videos of people, places, animals, or things?

60% time she uses camera to document things; 
40% to take photos; screenshots 1-2 times per 
month.

Do you prefer digital or analog (film) photos and 
videos? Why? 

Digital.  She likes the ease and instant gratification  
of having a photo right away.

Additional information Uses phone camera to mostly document things 
and her digital cameras to take photos.


Used to take professional photos with her Canon 
digital camera.


Texting is the platform she uses to share photos 
and videos with others.


She accesses others’ photos via text messages.


Does not organize photos but allows the Apple 
Photos program to do that for her.


Brought to light the issues of picture quality and 
ability to access photos and videos between iOS 
and Android platforms.


The persona of Joshua resonated with her most 
because she used to be more into photography 
and sharing photos, but life has gotten busy and 
she’s had to step back from photography.


